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ITEM CASE SIZE PROJ. USAGE BRAND PRICING COMMENTS W.B. Mason product Number BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING COMMENTS

1

*PCA 7139TP 3 Compartment Container w/ Lid (Aluminum) 250/cs 50

PACTIV 59.50$             PCTY139TP sunshine 29.87$             250 combo Durable 47.68$                   3CCOMBO

COMPARTMENT 

CONTAINER

250/CAS 73.54$                 Cas PACTIV 47.36$             200/CS Sys Pactiv -$                  

2

10 oz. Foam containers (Handicup)  1m/cs 300

DART 40.69$             DCC10B20 dart 40.59$             10B20 Dart 43.07$                   10B20

CUP HOT 10 OZ 

FOAM 

1000/CAS 

WHITE                            36.74$                 Cas DART 29.68$             NA -$                  

3

Lids for 10 oz foam cups 1m/cs 10

DART 24.25$             DCC20JL dart 21.99$             20JL Dart 23.69$                   20JL

 LID HOT 10 OZ 

FLAT

1000/CAS 

WHITE LIFT N© 

LOCK          25.03$                 Cas DART 22.37$             Dart 11.71$             

4

6" shallow paper plates  1m/cs 2m/cs 600

CHEF SUPPLY 21.50$             PRICED AS 2M/CS - SOLD 1M/CS SGV421278 plastirun 8.79$                1000/CS Plastirun 9.43$                      2600

PLATE 6" PAPER 

FLUTED 

UNCOATED  

10/100/CASE 

WHITE 15.10$                 Cas CERTO 14.38$             Sys Rel 14.23$             

5

Heavy wt. Plastic knife 1m/cs 900

CRYSTALWARE 10.89$             CSWSKNHWPPW1000 sunshine 11.97$             Summit 11.73$                   KDWB

KNIVES HEAVY 

WEIGHT

1000/CAS BLACK 

PP 17.18$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 13.07$             Sys Cls 29.74$             

6

Heavy wt. Plastic spoon 1m/cs 1200

CRYSTALWARE 10.89$             CSWSTSHWPPW1000 sunshine 11.97$             Summit 11.73$                   SDWB

SOUPSPOON 

HEAVY WEIGHT

1000/CAS BLACK 

PS 17.73$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 13.07$             Sys Cls 29.22$             

7

Heavy wt. Plastic fork 1m/cs 1000

CRYSTALWARE 10.89$             CSWSFHWPPW1000 sunshine 11.97$             Summit 11.73$                   FDWB

FORKS HEAVY 

WEIGHT

1000/CAS BLACK 

PS 23.30$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 13.07$             Sys Cls   29.50$             

8

5 oz. Translucent Cup 2500/cs 150

DART 46.75$             DCCY5CT dart 28.93$             Dart 30.66$                   5N25

CUP COLD 5 OZ 

PLASTIC SOFT

2500/CAS 

TRANSLUCENT 46.74$                 Cas FABRIKAL 38.02$             Sys Rel 68.11$             

9

8 oz Coffee cups Dart 8Lx 1000/cs 10

DART 22.39$             DCC8J8 dart 26.73$             Dart 26.23$                   8LX8E

CUP HOT 8 OZ 

PAPER

1000/CAS 

CAFE© DESIGN 36.35$                 Cas DART 27.63$             Sys Scl 22.20$             

10

Dixie Liddles 4 oz. w/ Translucent Tops   900/cs 200

no bid dixie 124.89$           Dixie 101.85$                 87220

CUP SOUFFLE 4 

OZ PLASTIC

2500/CAS CLEAR 

POLYPROPYLENE 47.70$                 Cas DIXIE 180.99$           NA -$                  

11

10 x 14 White Placements 1m/cs 200

HOFFMASTER 19.05$             HFMPM32052 plastirun 8.93$                Hoffmaster 19.96$                   MAT

PLACE MATS 

10X14 

EMBOSSED

1000/CAS 

WHITE 31.99$                 cas JAY JAMES 12.77$             2,000/CS Packer 10.55$             

12

P & G Dawn Liquid Detergent 6/50 oz. 30

DAWN 35.25$             ITEM IS 38OZ AND COMES 8/CS PGC45112CT p+g 38.47$             8-38 Oz. P&G 38.62$                   38169  8/32OZ

 DETERGENT 

DISH LIQUID 

DAWN

8/38OZ/CAS 53.25$                 Cas P  &  G 39.11$             Dawn -$                  8/38oz 

13

GoJo Antibacterial Refills (27 fl. oz.) 12/cs 20

no bid gojo 55.93$             12-800 ml. GoJo 56.24$                   9127-12

HAND SANITIZER 

GEL REFILL

12/800ML/CAS 56.55$                 Cas no bid NA -$                  

14

43 x 48 Heavy density trash bag 200/cs 10

HERTIAGE 22.95$             43X48, 22MIC,BK, 150/CS HERZ8648WKR01 aluf 38.67$             Berry 18.35$                   HC434816

LINERS TRASH 

43"X48" XHVY   

200/CAS NAT 

CORELESS VAL. 

HI-D 22.65$                 Cas BERRY 27.00$             150/CS Sys Cls 34.13$             

15

Heavy Duty Foil 18" x 1000 150

CRYSTALWARE 32.50$             CSWF18000HD sunshine 33.97$             STANDARD FOIL Durable 34.69$                   11803

ALUMINUM FOIL 

18"X1M©

1RL/BOX STD 

WGT 41.13$                 Rol OCALA 23.00$             500' Sys Cls 34.64$             500'

16

Disp. Foil ½ St.table Pan 4" deep 100/cs 50

CRYSTALWARE 19.50$             CSWFHSD100HD sunshine 17.99$             100 pc/cs Durable 27.93$                   6132-45

PAN STEAM 

TABLE ALUM 4-

3/16"

100/CAS 1/2 SZ 

EX-DEEP 85.91$                 Cas JIF 26.39$             Sys Cls 128.76$           

Received 2/26/2020 Received 2/26/2020Received 2/24/2020Received 2/20/2020

Mansfield Paper

CRT-NUTRITION DEPARTMENT PAPER SUPPLIES AND JANITORIAL ITEMS BID 2020
Due Friday, February 28, 2020 - Noon

Required Documents:  Bid on at least 50%, Electronic Pricing Grid, Bid Form & Sample COI

Appco Paper & Plastics

Bid Opening Monday, March 2, 2020 - 9am

W.B. Mason Go City Wide

Received 2/27/2020 Received 2/27/2020

Suburban Sysco



2

17

Disp. Foil full St.table Pan 4" deep 50/cs 65

CRYSTALWARE 30.25$             CSWFFSD50HD sunshine 28.99$             50 pc/cs Durable 39.27$                   6050-70

PAN STEAM 

TABLE ALUM 3-

3/8"

50/CAS FULL 

SIZE DEEP X 

HEAVY 45.58$                 Cas JIF 43.43$             Sys Cls 39.46$             

18

13" x 12" Dispenser Napkins White 6m/cs 350

MORCON 35.69$             MORD1213 morcon 36.47$             D1213 -6000/cs Morcon 29.81$                   123

NAPKIN 

MINISERVE JR 

12"X13" 

6000/CAS 

WHITE 41.28$                 Cas MORNAPJR 33.25$             Tork 86.34$             

19

Liquid Bleach  must be EPA approved  (seal) 6/cs 50

PURE BRIGHT 12.15$             KIK11008635042 j. austin 10.97$             Austin 13.98$                   B6-5

BLEACH 

GALLONS

6/1GAL/CAS 18.12$                 Cas KIK 16.14$             Sys Rel 15.11$             

20

Plastic aprons 1m/bx 20

AMBITEX 41.89$             ATXP2442 prc 37.87$             1000 /cs Siedman 44.69$                   EM

APRON PLASTIC 

28"X46" HEAVY 

WT

5/100/CAS 

WHITE 

EMBOSSED 80.76$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 39.93$             Sys Cls 55.61$             500/cs

21

Bordens sealwrap 18 x 2000 40

INTERPLAST 10.65$             IBSFSW1802K borden 11.87$             Western 11.86$                   914

FILM FOOD 

18"X2000©

1/ROLL CUTTER 

BOX PVC 20.20$                 Rol CERTO 14.76$             Sys Cls 31.65$             18x 3000

22

Plastic gloves (Large or Medium) 1 m 75

CRYSTALWARE 16.80$             CSWVGPCPFGL prc 16.89$             Vinyl -1000 Siedman 4.27$                      PLYVER

GLOVE VINYL 

GEN PURPOSE

MED 1000/CAS 

POWDERED 21.94$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 38.50$             Sys CLs 22.17$             

23

Latex gloves (Large) 10 bx/cs 1m/cs 52

CRYSTALWARE 27.39$             CSWLGPPFGL prc 28.90$             Latex -1000 Summit 20.98$                   V4221

GLOVE LATEX 

GEN. PURPOSE 

LRG

1000/CAS 

POWDERED 37.41$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 31.36$             Sys Rel 41.28$             XL

24

HI-D Sandwich bag 6.75 x7 3m/cs 10

no bid prc 19.83$             Elkay 9.24$                      6701  2M/CS

BAG POLY 7X7X1-

1/2 BACK FLIP

1000/CAS CLEAR 11.08$                 Cas ELKAY 10.69$             1000/CS Sys Cls 35.32$             

25

Boufant White Caps case 10

CRYSTALWARE 8.60$                PRICED AS 500/CS- SOLD 1000/CS CSWSBC21W1000 prc 17.95$             Siedman 23.46$                   DBWH21-1

Boufant White 

Caps

MED-

10/100/CAS 30.73$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 20.92$             NA -$                  

26

Dark Brown hairnets 1gr 30

SAFETY ZONE 8.25$                SADPLW22BR prc 8.97$                Disco 8.68$                      DPLW22BR

NET HAIR NYLON 

LT. BROWN 24"

144/BOX 

LT.WGT. 14.66$                 Box SAFETY ZONE 8.78$                Sys Cls 114.66$           

27

3M Scotch Brite Pad 20/bx 50

3M 14.90$             MMM96CC janico 17.39$             Royal 13.98$                   96D  60/CS

SCOURING PAD 

MEDIUM

20/CAS 6" X 9" 

GREEN 7.79$                   Cas 3M 13.67$             Sys Cls 8.88$                

28

Tablecloth 60 x120 35

HOFFMASTER 31.15$             HFM210130 hoffmaster 36.87$             54x108 24/cs Hoffmaster 33.64$                   17507

Tablecloth 60 

x120

24/CAS 44.35$                 Cas no bid Sys Cls 56.78$             54 x 108

29

Mr Muscle Oven Cleaner aerosol 6/cs 10

MR. MUSCEL 28.50$             SJN682556 e-z off 29.00$             6/cs Zenez 31.89$                   499185  12/20OZ

CLEANER OVEN 

& GRILL

12/20 OZ/CAS 

AEROSOL 71.33$                 Cas DIVERSEY 33.06$             Keystone 37.49$             4/32oz

30

P & G Liquid Comet 4

COMET 39.85$             PGC73163 comet 45.94$             8/cs P&G 46.78$                   07017  8/32OZ

CLEANER LIQUID 

CREAM BATH 

CLN

12/32OZ/CAS 

SPARCREME 43.26$                 Cas P & G 55.83$             8/CS Ecolab 111.26$           12/32oz

31

P & G Powder 24/21 oz. 20

AJAX 23.76$             CPC14278EA kitchen kleaner 19.97$             24/21 Ajax 24.86$                   04298

P & G Powder 

–WITH BLEACH-

21OZ/CAS 48.34$                 Cas P & G 40.85$             Keystone 15.35$             12/21oz

32

1.5 x 50 masking tape 24/cs 35

TESA 47.50$             TSA501240000200 r3 44.63$             15X60 2/cs -$                        

TAPE MASKING 

1-1/2" 60YDS/RL

24/CAS (O TO O) 54.84$                 Cas 3M 11.76$             12/CS NA -$                  

33

Multi fold bleach towels size is 13x24 and 72count 4000/cs 200

TORK 20.50$             TRKMK520A sunshine 14.93$             10x14 Marcal 13.63$                   P-200N

TOWEL 

MULTIFOLD 

4000/CAS 

WHITE 23.01$                 Cas GENUINE JOE 16.67$             Tork 42.94$             

34

Foam trays 7"x9" Celebrity 87900 500/cs 150

GEN PAK 27.25$             GNP87900 dart 31.69$             Dart 22.65$                   87900

TRAY FOAM 9-

1/4X7-1/4X1/2

500/CAS BLACK 25.18$                 Cas DART 41.54$             Sys Cls 42.38$             9x12

35

7 oz. cups (paper) 2400/cs 200

no bid dart 39.69$             plastic - 2500/cs Solo 81.67$                   R7N  2M/CS

CUP HOT 8 OZ 

PAPER

1000/CAS 

WHITE 35.96$                 Cas I P 93.92$             2500/CS Sysco Trendz 70.02$              

36

4S Foam trays 500/cs 275

PACTIV 33.50$             PCTTF104S0 ckf 14.99$             Genpak 17.32$                   TH104SO

FOAM TRAY 

WHITE 4S

500/CAS 30.79$                 Cas GENPAK 20.90$             Pactiv 43.16$             9x12

37

4S Foam trays blue 500/cs 300

no bid ckf 15.69$             Genpak 20.13$                   TF404SO

FOAM TRAY 

BLUE 4S

500/CAS 30.79$                 Cas GENPAK 20.90$             Pactiv 49.16$             14x18

38

2S foam trays 500/cs 20

no bid ckf 10.99$             Genpak 13.41$                   TH102S

FOAM TRAY 

WHITE 2S

500/CAS  21.20$                 Cas GENPAK 15.74$             -$                  
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39

Catering trays 16" black 50/cs 24

FINE LINE 58.30$             PRICED AS 50/CS- SOLD 25/CS FNLHR0016 fineline 24.49$             25/cs Fineline 29.80$                   HR16PPB  25/CS

TRAY PLASTIC 

16"ROUND  

FLAT

25/CAS BLACK 32.91$                 Cas WNA PET 37.68$             25/CS Sysco  56.99$             36/cs

40

Dome Covers for Catering trays 16" black 50/cs 25

FINE LINE 46.50$             PRICED AS 50/CS- SOLD 25/CS FNL9601L fineline 19.99$             25/cs Fineline 50.48$                   DD16

LID HIGH DOME 

PLASTIC 16"

25/CAS CLEAR 30.34$                 Cas WNA PET 33.24$             25/CS Sysco 30.21$             

41

Overable Pan Liners for 18"x26" "Pan Pals" 1000/cs 10

no bid elkay 24.37$             20x28 - 100/cs Durable 30.99$                   LO10

PAN LINERS 

QUILON 25#

1000/CAS 16-

1/2X24-1/2    43.36$                 Cas MC NAIRN 36.41$             Sysco 42.25$             16x24

42

5 Compartment Lunch  Foam Tray 500/cs 100

GEN PAK 33.37$             GNP10500 ckf 16.99$             Ecopax 15.64$                   ST-8

FOAM TRAY 5 

COMPARTMENT

LUNCH TRAY 

500/CAS     35.41$                 Cas ECOPAX 30.25$             Sysco 33.09$             

43

Sterno 12/cs 10

STERNO 41.30$             STE20102 handy fuel 30.79$             72/cs -2hours no wick Fancy Heat 31.99$                   HF03008  72/CS

CHAFING FUEL 

METHANOL 2-

1/2 HR

72/7 OZ/CAS 

BLUE 43.91$                 STERNO 47.11$             72/CS Hour Scl 49.18$             

44

Sports Towels/Chix wipe  8290 600/cs 12

CHIX 117.50$           CHI8470 chix wipe 33.69$             72/cs Chix 80.98$                   8290  72/CS

WIPER 12X21.5 

FOODSERVICE

200/CAS 

PINK/WHITE 18.38$                 Cas CHICOPEE 90.94$             Sysco 78.82$             

45

12 oz bowls 1000/cs 50

DART 17.15$             DCC12BWWCR dart 29.47$             Dart 29.98$                   12BWWF

12 oz bowls 

White plastic-

1000/CAS 44.93$                 Cas DART 18.82$             Sysco -$                  

46

3 compartment tray-Pact IV-hinged 200/cs 10

DART 50.55$             DCCC95PST3 yespac 29.47$             CI81023 - 8x8 Dart 35.68$                   C90PST3  250/CS

HINGED LID 

CONTAINER 3C 

FOAM

200/CAS 9-

1/4X9-1/4X3 

VENTED 24.75$                 Cas DART 19.51$             Pactiv 95.01$             

47

1 compartment tray, large-hinged 7" 200/cs 25

DART 51.65$             DCCC95PST1 yespac 28.29$             CI81020 - 8x8 Dart 35.68$                   C90PST1  250/CS

HING LID CONT 

FOAM 1C

200/CAS 8X7-

1/2X2-3/4 

WHITE 26.91$                 Cas DART 18.80$             Sysco 69.20$             

48

Chlorine Test Kits 2 roll/pk 30

no bid simoniz 5.79$                each vial Simoniz 12.24$                   CM-240  100/CS

TEST STRIPS FOR 

BLEACH

1RL/PKG 8.58$                   Pkg TCD 9.37$                PER ROLL DayDots 13.02$             1/15'

49

Chinet-First Choice 81239 plastic 3 compartment 9" plates  500/cs 1000

DART 34.15$             DCC9CPWF dart 22.79$             Dart 28.92$                   63900

Chinet-First 

Choice 81239 

plastic 3 

compartment 9" 

plates  

500/CS 78.45$                 cas DART 33.44$             Sys Rel -$                  

50

5 oz Genpak Chinet 81204 bowl 1M/cs 300

DART 29.76$             DCC5BWWFPK dart 22.43$             Dart 26.96$                   5BWWF

BOWL 5 OZ 

FOAM

1000/CAS 

WHITE NON 

LAMINATED 18.75$                 Cas no bid Sys Imp 89.02$             

51

6" Square Clear Hinged Lid Container 20

DART 38.50$             DCCC57PST1 dart 29.91$             Dart 33.98$                   C57PST1

HINGED LID 

CONTAINER 6"

500/CAS 

6X5.8X3 CLEAR   47.93$                 Cas PACTIV 42.80$             Sys Cls 53.00$             500/cs

52

24 oz. Black Microwaveable Container 300/cs 20

GEN PAK 45.05$             GNPFPR0243L dart 48.37$             B24SB -252/cs Genpak 50.75$                   FPR024

CONTAINER 24 

OZ ROUND 7"

300/CAS BLACK 

MICROWAVE 

BULK 32.58$                 OCALA 27.88$             150/CS Versa 76.51$             150 ct w lid

53

24 oz. Clear Microwaveable Lid 300/cs 20

GEN PAK 28.85$             GNPFPR932 dart 39.79$             C2464BDL -252/cs Genpak 39.87$                   FPR932

LID 24,32 & 40 

PLASTIC 7"

300/CAS CLEAR 

MICROWAVE 

BULK 31.01$                 Cas OCALA 37.16$             150/CS -$                  

54

24 oz. Clear Hinged Bowl 150ct.

no bid prc 20.79$             MUC24BCD -126/cs -$                        

24 oz. Clear 

Hinged Bowl

126/CASE 56.54$                 Cas IN LINE 68.03$             Genpak 43.44$             200 ct

55 Designed Plates w/colors all matching

Classic Cup 10 oz. 5 no bid fineline 36.93$             FI2410 -240/cs - clear -$                        9 oz paper hot cup-10/24/CAS 26.10$                 Cas no bid -$                  

Classic Plate 9" 5 no bid fineline - flareware 41.97$             FIN207_ - 180 -$                        9” paper plate-12/75/CAS 80.21$                 Cas no bid -$                  

Classic Plate 7" 5 no bid fineline - flareware 39.49$             FIN209_ - 180 -$                        7” paper plate -12/75/CAS 61.81$                 Cas no bid -$                  

56
Sporks Packet 1000/cs 30

CRYSTALWARE 12.15$             CSWSKPPWP1000 sunshine 10.89$             Summit 12.64$                   5670

Sporks Packet

1000/CASE 17.12$                 Cas GENUINE JOE 7.89$                Berk 27.12$             

57

Alcohol Pad individual wrap 12 bx/cs 15

ACM 3.70$                50/BOX ACM51019 winco 14.92$             200 /box Callico 24.64$                   B37900

Alcohol Pad 

individual wrap

10/100/CASE 32.65$                 Cas MEDLINE 2.61$                200/BX Clorox 34.13$             

58

Coffee Stirrers 10m/cs 10

CRYSTALWARE 7.60$                CSW5BSS101000 prc 6.95$                Callico 12.98$                   950SQP

Coffee Stirrers

7” WOODEN 

STIRRER-

10/1000/CAS 46.04$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 12.10$             Packer 21.41$             

59

Heavy Wt Plastic Soup Spoon 1m/cs 1000

CRYSTALWARE 10.89$             CSWSSSHWPPW1000 sunshine 11.97$             -$                        

TEASPOON 

HEAVY WEIGHT

1000/CAS BLACK 

PS 16.78$                 Cas SAFETY ZONE 13.07$             Pactiv 25.08$             
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BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING COMMENTS BRAND PRICING

IMPERIAL 39.95$                           VB3COMPFP CRYSTALWARE FC3CT250 39.90$             -$                                NO BID  Pactiv Senior Citizen Combo 42.25$                                                

DART 49.85$                           10B20 DART 10B20 85.92$             Dart 10J10 37.00$                             Dart White Use 10 Series Lid 29.66$                                                

DART 27.96$                           20JL DART 20JL 35.36$             Dart 10JL 21.39$                             Dart White Vented 17.17$                                                

PLASTIRUN 11.50$                           6S1M - 1000/CS VINTAGE A30200 15.67$             10/100CT RDA A30200 13.99$                             Certo White Uncoated     30200 14.20$                                                

IMPERIAL 19.95$                           AHK MERIT MBPHK-W 18.87$             Merit MBPHWK-W 16.24$                             Certo Polypro          BS1008P 13.22$                                                

IMPERIAL 19.95$                           AHS MERIT MBPHTS-W 18.87$             Merit MBPHWTS-W 16.24$                             Certo Polypro           103400 13.22$                                                

IMPERIAL 19.95$                           AHF MERIT MBPHF-W 18.87$             Merit MBPHWF-W 16.24$                             Certo Polypro           103200 13.22$                                                

FABRI-KAL 40.65$                           RK5 - 2500/CS DART Y5 41.09$             Dart Y5 36.69$                             Dart Translucent 29.92$                                                

DART 30.95$                           8LXE DART 8J8 32.55$             Dart 8J8 29.07$                            8XL 27.43$                                                

GEO-PAC 124.13$                         87220 Dixie 87220 130.34$           -$                                NO BID N/A

HOFFMASTER 18.95$                           1014WM HOFFMASTER 30659 26.78$             Hoffmaster 30659 23.92$                             Jay James 8.70$                                                  

P&G 49.20$                           DAWN - 8/38oz DAWN 45112 52.98$             8/38 oz/CS P&G 45112 46.14$                            38oz - 6/CS  P&G 37.90$                                                

GOJO 30.35$                           GOJO9127 GOJO 9757-12 106.85$           12/800 ml Gojo 9181 142.10$                          800ml  GoJo  Gold & Klean Bag-In-Box 42.66$                                                

IMPERIAL 26.75$                           F4348N16 CCI 4348X15CLF 21.07$             15mic CLEAR RDA AR434822B 30.53$                            22mic - 150/CS  DSC Natural Roll           8/2 19.16$                                                

IMPERIAL 77.35$                           11808 VINTAGE V35006 50.41$             RDA A299 55.92$                             Ocala 78 Gauge 20.46$                                                

IMPERIAL 31.07$                           VBHDSP VINTAGE V35081 29.75$             Western 5132P 33.19$                             Pactiv Economy            6132 23.48$                                                

Received 2/28/2020 (11:05 AM)

EBP
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IMPERIAL 44.20$                           VBFDSP VINTAGE V35083 44.16$             Western 5130P 47.14$                             Pactiv 28.23$                                                

IMPERIAL 27.10$                           LNAP12500 SCA L3141 46.13$             Morcon D1213 48.57$                             MornapJr White    31311 31.68$                                                

JAMES AUSTIN CO. 12.95$                           GABL JAUSTIN 48079 15.26$             KIK 11006755042 14.30$                            Pure Bright 13.99$                                                

SAFETY ZONE 50.57$                           2846APRON Hygrade AP100 28.70$             Safety Zone 50.39$                            DAP1.25-28x46  Royal Paper White 10/100 0.5 m 46.34$                                                

ANCHOR 17.85$                           18X2M AEP 18X2MCC 18.79$             RDA A182 17.17$                             Certo 12.50$                                                

IMPERIAL 19.90$                           64V3000PFL/M HOSPECO P500 49.00$             20BX/500CT/CS -$                                NO BID  Safety Zone 1000/bx 4.13$                                                  

IMPERIAL 29.90$                           62323PFL TRONEX 3667 38.92$             -$                                NO BID CERTO  Powder Free 17.95$                                                

ELARA 34.90$                           HD07 ELKAY H07 12.52$             1000/CS Elkay H07 33.54$                             Elkay 6.75 x 6.75 HiD Poly 8.71$                                                  

IMPERIAL 28.15$                           BOUFANT24 HOSPECO DA-BC210 16.38$             500/CS Safety Zone 12.14$                            DBWH-21-5  Safety Zone 19.99$                                                

KEYSTONE ADJUSTABLE 9.90$                              HAIRNETBR KEYSTONE 1091-DB 144.14$           10BX/144CT/CS Safety Zone 9.57$                              DPLW-22-BR  Royal 9.11$                                                  

3M 5.69$                              96 3M #96 9.70$                3M 96 12.25$                             3M Niagara 6 x 9 6.15$                                                  

HOFFMASTER 9.97$                              FT10801W HOFFMASTER 4108-W 45.51$             54" x 108" WHITE Hoffmaster 4108-W 40.64$                            54in x 108in  Hoffmaster 2 Ply Poly Backed 32.47$                                                

SCJ 29.97$                           MRMCLE19 SPARTAN 6280 56.94$             6/20 oz/CS Simoniz S3341012 44.94$                            12/CS  Diversey Break Up 19 oz Aeroso 27.10$                                                

HENKEL 34.71$                           SOFT13 COMET 73163 58.44$             10/32oz/CS P&G 73163 52.18$                            9/CS Comet 45.56$                                                

CELLUCAP 30.09$                           SCOUR AJAX 214278 28.45$             Colgate 214278 26.30$                             Starco  Dish Safe 31.17$                                                

SHURTAPE 35.83$                           1MT CCI 11737 132.59$           Shurtape 100567 46.80$                            1.5in x 60yd STA Force   1.5x50 35.44$                                                

SOLARIS 25.11$                           5110002 SCA MK520A 21.63$             Callico CD-P-200B 22.89$                            Tork 14.34$                                                

DART 44.67$                           9PRWQ Genpak 87900 59.57$             Genpak 4SWH 34.53$                             Dart White Laminated 32.61$                                                

IMPERIAL 35.17$                           8WHDC GRAPHIC PACKAGING DMR7-C 123.31$           2500/CS CHAMPAGNE DESIGN Solo R7NJ 114.27$                          2000/CS  IP Champagne Design 93.28$                                                

NOVIPAX 22.05$                           4SFM CFK 88134 49.31$             Genpak 4SWH 34.53$                             Genpak 9.25 x 7.25 x 1/2 18.77$                                                

GENPAK 29.95$                           4SBFM CFK 88051 #4PR 60.93$             Genpak 4SWH 34.53$                             Genpak 9.25 x 7.25 x .5 18.72$                                                

NOVIPAX 17.94$                           2SFM CFK 88103 39.13$             Genpak 2SWH 23.59$                             Genpak 8.25 5.75 1/2      EPG2 13.52$                                                
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DOUGLAS STEPHEN 40.86$                           STAK16RB WNA A916BL25 47.35$             25CT Callico DF-CP16 72.32$                             WNA Black Flat 37.50$                                                

DOUGLAS STEPHEN 29.29$                           LHP16STAK WNA A16PETDM 38.68$             25CT Callico DF-DCS920 32.45$                             WNA PET 27.54$                                                

NORPAK 33.09$                           F25Q BROWN PAPER GOODS 162-1 48.26$             24 3/8 x 16 3/8 -$                                NO BID  McNairn EnviroBake Greaseproof 48.87$                                                

PACTIV 29.50$                           TH10500 PACTIV YTH10500SGBX 42.31$             Pactiv YTH10500SGBX 37.78$                             Pactiv White 8.25 10.25 19.26$                                                

FANCY HEAT CORP. 33.65$                           F800 #10106 53.44$             24/CS Callico CL-10106 47.72$                            24/CS  LeJo Dine A Heat Blue  2.5 hr 29.50$                                                

BERRY 100.25$                         SF8470 103.18$           72/CS Chicopee 8470 156.64$                           Chicopee Lt duty white 6/100 78.37$                                                

DART 31.89$                           12BWWF DART 12BWWF 39.06$             Huhtamaki 22521 129.93$                           Dart Concorde Unlaminated 15.95$                                                

DART 41.14$                           C90PST3 Dart C90PST3 69.71$             250/CS Pactiv YTD1-8803 19.48$                             Pactiv Sensation 8 x 8 x 3 33.94$                                                

DART 41.14$                           C90PST1 DART C90PST1 52.25$             250/CS Dart 90HTPF1R 20.59$                             Pactiv 8.5 x 7.5 x 3 Sensation 29.52$                                                

MICRO ESSENTIAL LABS 7.25$                              CM240 SPARTAN 9849 5.17$                100/PK -$                                NO BID  TCD  Chlorine Range 0-200, Via 2.99$                                                  

DART 33.68$                           9CPWF HUHTAMAKI 81230 107.32$           10 1/4" -$                                NO BID  Dart Impact 29.61$                                                

DART 29.97$                           5BWWF DART 5BWWC 16.31$             -$                                NO BID Dart 29.99$                                                

DART 69.50$                           C25UT1 DART C57PST1 52.98$             Dart C57PST1 47.30$                             Dart Sandwich 6 L x 5.8 W x 3 34.97$                                                

GENPAK 57.19$                           FPR024 GENPAK FPR024 66.56$             300/CS Genpak FPRO243L 66.84$                             Genpak Black Smart Set 48.96$                                                

GENPAK 47.40$                           FPR932 GENPAK FPR932 52.29$             300/CS Genpak FPR932 49.55$                             Genpak Fits FPR024 FPR032 38.47$                                                

DART 43.57$                           PET24BCD GENPAK AD24 52.88$             200/CS -$                                NO BID  Genpak 24 oz Clear PET Flat Li 39.90$                                                

GEO-PAC 99.33$                           92959 SOLO SYMPHONY R9N-S 136.95$           2000/CS -$                                NO BID Cup Hot Paper 10oz Tall HC10TCA 33.46$                                                       

GEO-PAC 59.25$                           SX9DI SOLO SYMPHONY MP9-S 40.70$             500/CS -$                                NO BID Plate Paper 6 7/8" Medium 98171 38.68$                                                       

GEO-PAC 38.95$                           SX6DI SOLO SYMPHONY MP6-S 63.45$             1000/CS -$                                NO BID Plate Paper 8 3/4" Hvy    98077 29.66$                                                       

SUPER WIN 14.25$                           75002980 No Bid No Bid No Bid Safety Zone 7.20$                              CPPMDSKBKW1 Kit Spork Napkin Straw SPKKIT10 13.53$                                                       

MCKESSON MEDICAL 44.00$                           98721 SANFACON 33928 29.67$             10BX/100CT/CS Custom Kits 81104 24.00$                            200/BX Alcohol Med Prep Pads   090735Z 2.58$                                                         

IMPERIAL 10.95$                           101BK MERIT 958 5" 14.13$             10/1000CT Safety Zone 12.44$                            ST205R Stirrer Coffee 5.5" Wood 421388 17.75$                                                       

IMPERIAL 19.95$                           AHSS MERIT MBPHWSS-W 18.87$             1000/CS Safety Zone -$                                CPSHWSSBKW1 Heavy Weight Soup Spoon 13.32$                                                       


